
GEMS OF LIGHT
SAINT GERMAIN
I am sure there is not one of you who when you have accom­
plished something, have not felt a rejoicing that can come 
alone from that. After so many centuries of dominion of the 
human self, your power of dominion now conciously brought 
into action in the call to your Presence, is the greatest happi­
ness that can come to one in human form.

SAINT GERMAIN
Never weary of your application, because that is the Open 
Door-way to your Dominion and Freedom forever!

SAINT GERMAIN
There is not one single excuse for any human being feeling 
doubt toward This Work or the Messengers —  not one single 
excuse. The books are simple, plain and substantial. The 
teachings are plain, practical and substantial and the Messen­
gers have never said one solitary thing to which any sane in­
dividual can take exception.

SAINT GERMAIN
You are master of your bodies. Don’t humor your human 
atoms a particle and don’t fear them, but say to them: “Get 
into action now and stop that nonsense” ! Be absolute in hand­
ling your physical bodies, don’t let them master you.

K-17
A thing can act thru the feeling world and get the feelings 
stirred into action before the individual is aware of it. That 
is why you should be so constantly on guard, about any dis­
turbing condition or desire to criticise each other or any 
condition, which would open you to the forces that are act­
ing in those destructive qualities.

K-17
Dear ones, if you really knew and understood the Authority 
and Power which each one of you has to say to a condition, 
whatever it is, that has an appearance of destructive activity; 
“You have no power,” and know it was the Power of Light 
from your Presence going forth into that, you could perform 
wonders.
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